
 





 To: Participants and Spectators of the 2022 World Series Events. 
 
On behalf of DBB, Inc., it is with great enthusiasm I welcome you to the 2022 DBB 
World Series baseball for four of our age divisions. We had a wonderful 65th 

Anniversary celebration in 2021. Youth baseball is rebounding from the COVID-19 
pandemic. While we pause to remember those impacted; it is our hope in moving 
forward these fun-filled events will provide, a lot of enjoyment. Countless 
volunteers give many hours of dedicated service in order for young people to enjoy 
baseball. It is a true blessing to have outstanding leadership in DBB and within our 
local leagues. We thank everyone that has contributed to the success of our 2022 
program. 

 
We are honored Discover Monroe -West Monroe extended an invitation for us to 
visit. Alana Cooper, President and CEO, fully supports our extended partnership, 
enabling us to offer quality World Series events at the outstanding facilities of the 
Sterlington Sports Complex and ULM Warhawk Field. Dr. Ronald Berry, President of 
University of Louisiana Monroe made available campus facilities for our use. Coach 
Michael Federico, ULM Baseball Coach, is providing the recently renovated 
Warhawk Field for a weekend of action with the DBB Pre-Majors tournament. The 
entire venue is included for our meetings and the opening ceremony. This is truly a 
joint effort! 

 
Scott Bruscato, Sr. Vice President of Discover Monroe – West Monroe and the entire 
CVB staff are great to work with. Scott oversees all of the events as the host event 
director. The 2021 World Series events included our introduction to having all of our 
events in one locale. DBB enjoyed excellent hospitality as well as outstanding 
baseball displayed throughout the five tournaments. Discover Monroe – West Monroe 
received statewide recognition for the successful 2021 event. The 2022 World Series 
events will also be outstanding. We recognize the commitment level and understand 
the logistics. 

 
During your visit there are many opportunities available for dining, coupled with 
the area attractions you will really want to visit. Baseball action at the Sterlington 
Sports Complex (five playing fields) coupled with Warhawk Field provide 
opportunities to witness baseball games from four divisions of DBB. We thank Kerry 
Elee and Ben Sheets, co-owners of 2 Seam Sports for allowing us to book events at 
the Sterlington Sports Complex. Best wishes to the fifty (50) plus DBB tournament 
teams in action July 20-27, 2022. 

 

 
James Sandy Jones 
DBB Commissioner/CEO 

 



Sterlington 

Louisiana

Players 

Christian Brown 

Braiden Boatnight 

Kade Hollingsworth 

Dawson Moses 

Keylan Sandidge 

Jaxon Garner 

Davis Holt 

Drake Dailey 

Lee Cotton 

Holden Herring 

Collin Thomas 

Drake Danner 

 

Coaches 

Chris Brown- Manager 

Stuart Dailey 

Matt Thomas 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Dothan 

Alabama

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Springhill 

Florida 

Players 

Tommy Celotto  

Braydon Cook  

CJ Gillespie 

Chase Hasty 

Camden Heath 

Paul Kymer  

Beckett Monroe  

David Moore 

Nikolas Nazario  

Dillon Olding  

Roger Parido  

Jayden Toth  

Cashis Williams 

 

Coaches 

Shawn Gillespie- Manager 

Mike Huckaby  

James Parido 

 



Newton County 

Georgia 

Players 

Amond Sands 

Anslee Tribble 

Cameron Scott 

Devonte Hardeman 

Ian Copeland 

Jakobi Jones-Barnes 

Jayden Colbert 

Kurt Campbell 

Maze Cox 

Moxie McNeally 

Parker Denmark 

Sage Lovelace 

 

Coaches 

Tae Lovelace- Manager 

James Denmark 

Mike Campbell 

Eric Copeland 

 



JPRD West 

Louisiana

Players 

Evan Dusang  

Isaiah Fields  

Cameron Gallicio 

 Jeremy Gibson  

Yasir Jabbar  

Adrian Lambourg 

Ethan Lentz  

Kaden Lew  

Peyton Matherne  

Giovanni Pastrana 

 Brody Pouwels  

Paxton Schieffler 

 Blaise Tingstrom  

Dominick Zuniga  

 

Coaches 

Kurt Cavalier- Manager 

Phill Bodden 

Wayne Jackson 

Sam Montalbono 

 

 



Hattiesburg 

Mississippi

Players 

     Shawn Armstrong 

Blaze Bourgoyne 

J.B. Bryant 

Amari Hill 

 

Joel Hux 

Hatten Jussely 

Haedyn Leverette 

Cooper McCoy 

Maddox Nicholas 

 Lou Odom  

Myles Prince  

Chancellor Rogers 

Skyler Dee Ward

 

Coaches 

Chris Bedenbaugh- Manager 

Monte Prince 

Josh Jussely 

Tony Ward 



Columbus County 

North Carolina

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Players 

Colton Allen 

Camden Butler 

Jacob Godwin 

Collin Hooks  

Austin Jacobs 

Landyn Jacobs  

Adrion Jenrette  

Layton McLean  

Brooks McLean 

 Tyler Mishue 

 Jake Odham 

 Gage Simmons  

Jayden Todd 

Braylon Waddell 

 

Coaches 

David Butler- Manager 

Lynn Mishue 

Austin Odham 

Tyrell Waddell 



Central-Clemson 

South Carolina

Players 

Luke Vernon  

Bradley Runion  

Jack Christmas 

Cade McKibben 

 Ty Simpson  

Cade Simpson  

Theo LeMahieu  

Jackson Ownbey  

Luke Turner 

 Ryan Hendricks 

Jayden Hughes 

 

Coaches 

Josh Runion- Manager 

Eric McKibben 

Jamie Ownbey 

 



Sweetwater 

Tennessee

Players 

Landon Albright  

Bryson Burgess 

Nolan Dacus  

Max Denietolis  

Austin Evans  

Corbyn Frisbie  

Ryne Moore 

Corbin Nile  

Evan Preston  

Rylan Saffles  

Kam Silcox 

Riley Twilbeck 

 

Coaches 

Josh Burgess- Manager 

Jason Dacus 

Josh Moore 

Michael Preston 



Livingston 

Texas

Players 

Karter Nelson  

Landon Hodges  

TJ Garner  

Mason Lusk  

Jacob Wood  

Wyatt Ogden  

Jaxson David  

Caidyn Hoover  

Isaiah Leahy  

Anthony Vasquez 

 

Coaches 

Clint Davis- Manager 

Justin Hodges 

Matt Wood 



Center 

Texas 

Players 

Zy Barnes 

 Jackson Holloway  

Keithan Horton 

Jayden Lane 

Eli Lout  

Case Milford  

Kayden Nutt  

Jace Radney  

Conrad Shaham  

Gage Vidrine 

Easton Wulf 

 

Coaches 

Brian Horton- Manager 

Ben Wulf 

James Radney 

 



Cana 

Virginia 

Players 

Klay Dalton  

Colten Gravley 

Colby Goad 

Peyton Goad  

Reid Horton  

Caden Kelly 

Dane Leonard  

Colten Quesenberry  

Blake Reed  

Peyton Spencer  

Eli Worrell 

 

Coaches 

Larry Snow- Manager 

Jason Hart 

Brian Quesenberry 


